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1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) , , a , -  i . 4 -  

2. Gross Intrastate Revenue 
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3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Teleconununications Companies* 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 

$ 4. 

5.  

6. 

7. 

TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) 

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ *. AUS ~ 

CAF _I 

CMP - 
COM Î 
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To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
RE: 

Ok, thank you. 

__.__ Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Tuesday, January 29, 2002 2:37 PM 
To: Linda Williams 
Subject: RE: 

I haven't seen that version yet (it's probably on the way to me). Yeis, it is OK to open 
the docket. I will forward the copy of my file to Jackie Gilchrist. 

_._._ Original Message----- 
From: Linda Williams 
Sent: Tuesday, January 29, 2002 2:29 PM 
TO: Paula Isler 
Subject: RE: 

We got this copy of the RAF FORM today, they did pay the RAFS with p % i., and that note 
is at the bottom of the RAF FORM stating they no longer in business a,s of 1/01 and request 
that form on the back of the form. 
_ _ _ _ _  Oriqinal Messaqe----- 
From: Paila Isler 
Sent: Tuesdav. January 29, 2002 2:12 PM 
To: Linda Wiiiiams 
Subject: RE: 

On 1/10, Fiscal sent me a copy of his RAF form with the note "requesting cancellation." I 
wrote him on 1/17 and explained he had to pay the 2001 RAF and a $3.03 P&I balance from 
2000 RAF before we could open a docket to voluntarily cancel his certificate. I have not 
seen any note asking us to send him a form letter, whatever that may 'De. Did he pay the 
RAF and past due P&I? When did you get the copy of the RAF form? I (don't know what to 
tell you without that information first. 

_ _ _ _ _  Original Message----- 
From: Linda Williams 
Sent: Tuesday, January 29, 2002 12:43 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject : 

Paula we got a copy of RAF Form from Fiscal for Jim Patterson (TG477). At the end of the 
form he says he's no longer in business as of Jan. 01. He also wants us to send him a 
form letter so he can outline what he thought of the service we provide. Fiscal did copy 
you on this. 

Do you want me to open a docket now? 
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