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4/11/02********3:01 PM********Kay Flynn*********]_

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and TI048)
Will do.

Thanks, Paula.

-----Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, April 11, 2002 2:32 PM

To: Kay Fiynn

Subject: FW: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and TI048)

Kay: Please open a docket with the following title:

Bankruptcy cancellation by the Florida Public Service Commission for Interexchange Carrier Certificate No. 2994 and

Alternative Local Exchange Carrier Certificate No. 5711 issued to Network Plus, inc. d/b/a Hale and Father, Inc.,
effective 5/10/02.

Let me know if you have any questions. Thanks.

-----Original Message--—-

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2002 1:48 PM

To: Kay Flynn

Subject: RE: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and T1048)

Will do. Thanks.

----- Original Message-----

From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2002 1:44 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and T1048)

Okay. Be on the lookout for it. it's DN 03979-02.
Thanks.

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2002 1:39 PM

To: Kay Flynn

Subject: RE: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and T1048)

Can you scan it and let me read it and then I'll get back with you? 1 think V'll still have to contact them either way just to
explain the difference between bankruptcy and voluntary cancellations. One company paid the RAFs even though they

had filed for bankruptcy because they did not want it on the record that it was a bankruptcy cancellation. They may also
want a voluntary cancellation.
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From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2002 1:27 PM

To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and Ti048)

I'm reading this application, and realize now that what they're saying is the company filed for Chapter 11 bankruptcy
protection. Does that make a difference in handling this?

----- Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2002 1:03 PM

To: Kay Flynn

Subject: RE: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and T1048)

It is OK only if they stated in the letter when they will pay the 2002 RAF. Otherwise, send to me and I'll attempt collection
prior to opening a docket. Thanks.

-----Original Message-—-

From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Wednesday, April 10, 2002 11:23 AM

To: Paula Isler

Subject: Network Plus d/b/a Hale and Father (TX233 and TI048)

Paula, we got a pleading titied "Application” today from Swidler Berlin law firm to cancel this company's certs and they're
asking that it be done by 5/10 (when BellSouth discontinues underlying service).

Okay to open the docket?

Kay



