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Jackie Gilchrist

S/3/62
{

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, May 02, 2002 11:59 AM
To: Adam Teitzman

Cc: Jackie Gilchrist

Subject: Docket No. 020360-TC

Hi Adam. Today, I got proof that this company paid the past due RAF in full, including
the 2002 RAF. This docket was on the recommendation with 020289-TC, 020361-TC and 020362~
TC. I am retyping the recommendation removing all reference to 020360-TC. Also, I will
forward the file to Jackie Gilchrist for handling as a voluntary cancellation. :

Jackie, please have whoever you assign to the case change the docket title to a voluntary
cancellation instead of a cancellation by the PSC and change OPR staff. It is currently
scheduled for the 5/21 Agenda (5/9 filing date). Thanks!
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Ruth Nettles

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, May 06, 2002 4.05 PM
To: Ruth Nettles

Cc: Adam Teitzman

Subject: RE: 020360

03/13/02

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Monday, May 06, 2002 4:02 PM
To: Paula Isler

Cc: Adam Teitzman

Subject: 020360

I'm updating the above mentioned dkt., I need to know the effective date of the
cancellation.

Thanks.



