ORIGINAL

REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET O30620-TC
(PLEASE TYPE)

*o

Date 1/2/03 Docket No._

1. Division Name/Staff Name Division of Competitive Markets and Enforcement/McCoy

2. OPR Toni_McCoy/CMP N,

= {

3. OCR Legal

4. Suggested Docket Title Request for cancellation of Pay Telephone Services Certificate No. 7294 by
David Frazier 111, effective 2/25/02.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.
B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any):

6. Check one:
XX Documentation is attached.

Documentation will be provided with recommendation.

PSC/CCA010-C (Rev 10/01)
G: \FORMS\DOCKETFORMPAT .wpd

DOCUMENT HIMARTL-DATE
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FRRL-nNMMISSINNK CLERK



S

721762

COMPANY NAME: David Frazier IIT CO. CODE:_TG640
COMPANY LIAISON: Same, Owner
DOCKET NO. : CERTIFICATE NO.:_7294 EFFECTIVE:_01/06/00

RAF RETURN NOTICE:

DELINQUENT NOTICE:

OTHER RETURNED MAIL:

CCA’S RETURNED MAIL:

YEAR (s) RAFs NOT PAID: 2002

YEAR (s) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID:

REVENUES/YEAR:

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT:

OTHER INFORMATION

12/16/02 - Received call from Mr. Frazier who stated that he notified Jackie

Knight via fax on February 25, 2002 that he was reguesting

cancellation of his certificate.

I explained that our records do

not show receipt of the fax and asked if he had contacted JK. He

he tried, but she was not in. He is still receiving mail from the

Commission and he wants his certificate cancelled.

I explained

that he would stil] have to pay the 2002 RAF or provide a date




Continued

12/16/02 -

certain it would be paid. I asked if he had a copy of what he

faxed to JK. He said ves and would fax it to me.

See attached written request for cancellation dated 2/25/02.

Mr. Frazier called right back and asked if I had received the

fax. I stated ves. He asked if we could cancel his certificate

with the February 25, 2002 effective date. T stated we could if

complied with the cancellation rule by either paving the 2002 RAF

or providing us the date he will pay it. He said he would pay it

by the due date of January 30, 2003. I asked him to fax me a

statement of intent regarding the RAF.

See attached fax from Mr. Frazier advising that the 2002 RAF will

be paid by January 30th.

Forwarded file to Jackie Gilchrist for handling.

Voluntary cancellation, Effective 02/25/02.




Paula Isler

From: NET SatisFAXtion [postmaster]
To: Paula Isler
Subject: 3523720490, 1 page(s)

This is a FAX message received by NET SatisFAXtion

Received: 12/16/2002 12:07 PM
Total pages: 1
CSID: 3523720490

Transfer time: 0:00:42
Transfer rate: 300

Error count: 0
Port used: Rockwell 56000 External M..._#12
Status: Success

FAXTIF



FROM : DAVID FRAZIER FRX NO. @ 3523728490 Dec. 16 2082 @1:26PM P1
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Paula Isler

From: NET SatisFAXtion [postmaster]
To: Paula Isler
Subject: 3523720490, 1 page(s)

This is a FAX message received by NET SatisFAXtion

Received: 12/16/2002 11:49 AM
Total pages: 1
CSID: 3523720490

Transfer time: 0:00:44
Transfer rate: 300

Error count: 0
Port used: Rockwell 56000 External M...#l11
Status: Success

FAX.TIF
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FROM : DAVID FRAZIER

BOYS & GIRLS CLUB
OF ALACHUA COUNTY

Adml ti

PO, Box 532 .

2700 NW 515t Street
Galnesvllle, FL 324602

{352)372-5342

Southeast Unlt .
1100 SE 17th Drive
Galnesvllle, FL 32601
(352)372-1485

Northwest Unit

2700 NW 51st Street
Galnesville, FL 32606
(352)373-6639

Woodland Park Unit
Woodland Park Housing
Development

To:

From:

FAX NO. @ 3523720490 Dec. 16 2002 B1:85PM P1

Fax Cover Sheet.

Date: 2/9_;’/01__..

Company Name Dav'd frazier T —

Ko 9ht
BSo ~4t1 3 -62 4K

Contact Tmc_[{ N €.

Fagc ¥

Bo’ys & Girls Club
of Alachua County

Namc_DmV‘.c‘ J(fd?ﬂ"@( i

Number of pages (including cover page) l

If you have any problems recelving this document please call

(352)372-5342. \
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