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Ruth Nettles

L
To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: TI994/Westel, Inc.

Very good, we'll open a docket for today and I'll move DN 00502-03 to new docket. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2003 12:20 PM
To: Ruth Nettles

Subject: RE: TI994/Westel, Inc.

Yes, it is OK to open a docket with an effective date of 12/31/02. Put this information
you received today with Document No. 00902-03. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2003 12:16 PM

To: Paula Isler
Subject: TI99%4/Westel, Inc.

Paula, we received payment of $18 from company; in response to your fax dated 1/30/03.
Should we open a cancellation docket? Let me know. Thank you.
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