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TO: CLERK OF PUBLIC SERVICE COMM.
CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER
2540 SHUMARD OAK BLVD.

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850

THOMAS E. CANTRELL

TREASURER SAN MARTIN GROUP
10440 SAN MARTIN BLVD.
ST. PETERSBURG, FL 33702-1462
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THIS IS ALETTER OF CANCELLATION FOR THE CERTIFICATE
THAT WAS ISSUED TO ME FOR THE EXPRESS USE OF INSTALLING
AND OPERATING A PAYPHONE IN OUR GROUPS BUILDING TO
OFFSET THE COST OF A PAYPHONE. IT HAS BEEN PROVEN TO BE
FAR MORE COSTLY THAN ORIGINALLY THOUGHT AND OUR
GROUP CANNOT SUPPORT THE COST AT THIS TIME. THANK YOU

AND YOUR OFFICE FOR ALL THE HELP THAT YOU HAVE GIVEN ME
TO OBTAIN THE CERTIFICATE.

SINCERELY

THOMAS E. CANTRELL
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Ruth Nettleg ***x s Official Filing 6/23/2003 11:49 AM

Ruth Nettles

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: TG919

No mention of any payments. I'll place in undocketed.for now.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, June 23, 2003 10:19 AM
To: Ruth Nettles

Subject: RE: TG919

Did he include payment for the 2003 RAF or state when it would be paid? If not, do not
open a docket. If yes, you can open a docket.

————— Original Message----~-

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Monday, June 23, 2003 10:05 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TG919

Good morning.

I have a letter from Mr. Cantrell requesting cancellation of certiifcate. Can we open a
cancellation docket. FYI, no payment was included.



