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Kay Flynn 030933- T Z  

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Kay Flynn 
Thursday, September 25,2003 823 AM 
Paula Mer; Jackie Gilchrist 
RE: T-NETIX (TJ442) 

us& 
Great. Thanks. We'llGis to do so. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Paula  Isler 
Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2003 8:19 AM 
To: Jackie Gilchrist; Kay Flynn 
Subject: RE: T-NET1.X ( T J 4 4 2 )  

Yes, it is OK. They are now up to date on RAFs. 

__--- Original Message----- 
From: Jackie Gilchrist 
Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2003 8:Ol AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: FW: T-NETIX (TJ442) 

I'm thinking its ok, but please confirm. 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Kay Flynn 
Sent: Wednesday, September 24, 2003 5:25 PM 
T o :  Jackie Gilchrist 
Subject: T-NETIX (TJ442) 

Jackie, we received a payment today from this company f o r  2001 P/I and 2003 RAFs. They had 
earlier written and asked to cancel their registration. (See DN 08263-03 filed 9/4/03.) Is 
it okay now to open a docket f o r  voluntary cancellation? 
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