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To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: Request to cancel

Okay. Thanks, Paula.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, January 27, 2004 11:38 AM
To: Ruth Nettles

Cc: Jackie Gilchrist

Subject: RE: Request to cancel

Yes, make effective date 12/31/03.

----- Original Message—-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Tuesday, January 27, 2004 11:33 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: Request to cancel

W

He also sent in $50 payment for 2003 RAFs.

~~~~~ Original Message-—----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Tuesday, January 27, 2004 11:31 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: Request to cancel

Good morning.

I have a cy of 1/22/04 letter from American Management & Holdings Group, Inc.
[TG957] /Gliski requesting cancellation of certificate. Can I open a docket for

cancellation?

Thanks, Paula.
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