
Ruth Nettles ************ Official Filing 1/29/2004 I 2 2 4  PM 

Ruth Nettles 

To: 
cc: 
Subject: 

Paula Mer 
Jackie Gilchrist 
RE: TRM CommunicationsTTG480 

Okay, I w i l l  open a docket  today .  

Thanks, a g a i n .  * 

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Paula  Isler 
S e n t :  Thursday, January  29, 2004 12:21 PM - 

To: Ruth Nettles 
C c :  Jack ie  G i l c h r i s t  
S u b j e c t :  RE: TRM Communications/TG480 

Good morning Ruth. On 1/14/04,  F i s c a l  s e n t  m e  a copy of a l e t t e r  from Timothy McVeigh 
a d v i s i n g  he  c l o s e d  h i s  business 12/31/02.  H e  r e t u r n e d  t h e  2003 RAF r e t u r n ,  b u t  no check. 
I wrote  him a l e t t e r  on 1 /15/04  a d v i s i n g  I could  n o t  find a p r e v i o u s  r e q u e s t  f o r  
c a n c e l l a t i o n  and s t a t e d  t h a t  i f  t h e  $50 f o r  2003 was postmarked by 1/30/04, w e  would open 
a d o c k e t .  So, yes  i t  i s  OK t o  open a docket  wi th  an e f f e c t i v e  d a t e  of 1 2 / 3 1 / 0 3 .  

Jackie ,  I w i l l  forward a copy of m y  file t o  you f o r  your  r e c o r d s .  

Thanks. 

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Ruth N e t t l e s  
S e n t :  Thursday, January  29, 2004 12:06 PM 
To: Paula  Isler 
S u b j e c t :  TRM Communications/?-G480 

Good morning. 

I have a RAFs from company f o r  2003 w i t h  $50 payment. T h e r e ' s  a hand w r i t t e n  n o t e  on t h e  
RAF form, "company c l o s e d  12 /31 /02 .  Please c a n c e l  c e r t i f i c a t e  for 2004  and beyond". 

Please l e t  m e  know i f  I can  open a docket  for t h i s  company's r e q u e s t .  Thanks, Paula .  


