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Ruth Nettles
To: Jackie Gilchrist 0‘“‘(0' lOl" T-i._:-
Subject: RE: Good afternoon

Thanks, Jackie. I appreciate your help. ) OR!G,NAL

————— Original Message-—---—-
From: Jackie Gilchrist ) “AUS
Sent: Tuesday, February 03, 2004 2:21 PM - CAF
To: Ruth Nettles CMP __
Subject: RE: Good afternoon COoM ____
CTR ____
EGR __
The information for the docket titles below is correct. GGL __
OPC
————— Original Message----- MME T
From: Ruth Nettles SEC :I‘_‘
Sent: Tuesday, February 03, 2004 1:10 PM OTH

To: Jackie Gilchrist
Cc: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: Good afternoon

Hello, Jackie.
I will open three dockets for the following:

Request for cancellation of IXC Registration No. TI609 by ATS, effective 12/31/03.
Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 8397 by Atlantic Telecommunication
Systems, Inc., effective 12/31/03.

and
Request for cancellation of AAV Certificate No. 4839 by Atlantic Telecommunication

Systems, Inc., effective 12/31/03.

I'm ready to docket the above, please confirm that the information is correct for docket
titles.

Thanks, Jackie.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, February 02, 2004 2:00 PM
To: Ruth Nettles; Jackie Gilchrist
Subject: FW: Good afternoon

Jackie, since your group will be handling this docket, I'll let you advise Ruth. Thanks.
————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles
Sent: Monday, February 02, 2004 1:55 PM

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: Good afternoon

Yes, all three RAFs had $50 payments, accordingly, I will open three dockets. Paula, can I
combine the TG095 and TAQ042 cancellations in one docket?

————— Original Message-----
From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, February 02, 2004 1:44 PM e MR D ATE
To: Ruth Neﬁéles v DOCUMEINT KUMPER DATE
Cc: Jackie Gilchrist ~ 3 2
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Subject: RE: Good afterncon

If payment of the $50 RAF was paid for the other two also, it is OK to open dockets for
them too. Same effective date.

————— Criginal Message---——-

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Monday, February 02, 2004 12:34 PM
To: Paula Isler

Cc: Jackie Edwards

Subject: RE: Good afternoon

Thanks Paula. I have the two other RAFs that seems to come from the same president, the
codes are for TI609 and TG095.

————— Original Message=-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, February 02, 2004 12:28 PM
To: Ruth Nettles

Cc: Jackie Gilchrist

Subject: RE: Good afternoon

Hi Ruth. It is OK to open a docket with an effective date of 12/31/03. They are paid in
full through 2003 with this $50 payment. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Monday, February 02, 2004 12:26 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: Good afternoon

Paula, we have received a 2003 RAF from Atlantic Telecommunication Systems, Inc. (TA042)
for $50, on the RAF there's a note, "no longer operating"”. What shall we do? I have place
it in undocketed, DN 01450-04. Let me know what you find out. Thanks, Paula.



