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From: 
Sent: 
To: 
cc: 
Subject: 

Paula Mer 
Tuesday, March 30,2004 8: 13 AM 
Kay Flynn 
Jackie Gilchrist 
RE: TG945, DN 04009-04 

Yes. They've already paid 2003, so this $50 must be for 2004. Make the effective date the date the 
Commission received it. Thanks. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Kay Flynn 
Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2004 7:26 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG945, DN 04009-04 

Paula, good morning. This company paid $50 and says they are no longer a PATS provider--"at the above 
address." Do we open a docket for voluntary cancelfation? 
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