Dorothy Menasco OH0L10 — T

From: Paula Isier

Sent: Friday, June 25, 2004 2:18 PM
To: Dorothy Menasco

Subject: RE: IXC Cert No. 7916

Yes, it is OK to open a docket with an effective date of today. Their RAFs are paid up
through 2003. 'Fhanks and have a good weekend!

————— Original Message-----

From: Dorothy Menasco

Sent: Friday, June 25, 2004 2:01 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: IXC Cert No. 7916

I have a letter from World Communicaticns Satellite Services, Inc. requesting cancellation
of Cert No. 7916 to provide IXC service. They indicate that they will pay any RAFs owed
within 60 days of the cancellation of its certificate and that there are no open dockets
for them. Should we open a docket to cancel the certificate?
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