
TE92W-O-D 
K. K. Chiy Inc. 
10855 Sunset Drive. # 10 & 11 
hliami,FL 33173-2719 

February 18,2005 

5 I -  42 MAR I 2 2005 
Dear Certificate Holder: 

The Division of the Commission's Clerk and Adrmnishative Services has forwarded your account to OUT ofice to 
address the nonpayment of the Regulatory Assessment Fees (RAFs) required by Section 354.336, Florida Shtutes, and Rule 
25-4.0161, Florida Administmtive Code, for the year 2004. which was due January 3 1,2005. The W s  return form was 
nutiled to you on December 15,2004, and to date, Commission records reflect that payment bas not been received. 

Aecordlng to Florida Law, you are required to add interest charge at 12% per annum, and a 5% penalty for 
each 3May  period or fraction thereof, beyond the due date, up to a maximum of 25% in addition tu the deliaquent 
amount due. h addition, pursuant to Section 364.285, Florida Statutes, the Commission is authorized to impom upon an): 
entity subject to its jurisdiction a penalty of not more than $25,000 for each offense, if such entity is found lo have refused 
to comply d t b  or to have willfully violated any lawful rule or order of tbe Commission, or my provision of Chapter 3M. 

Utilities ate charged with knowledge of our NIW and stanrres. Momver, it is general Commission practice that all 
utilities that apply for certificate receive a copy of a11 applicable rules. F d r ,  in eccwdaoce with Section 364,335, Florida 
Statutes, as part of the application process, utilities provide an affidavit indicatmg that they have read and understood the 
applicable rules. 

If yau wish to request another fonn, please contact David Brown or Valorie Moore at the number below. 
The payment should be identified with the company code and the company's mm. Failure to provide papent  within 15 
days of this notlce will result in the estabkhmnt of a docket to address your failure to return the 'IzAFs form and pay 
R4Fs in accordance with Section 364.336, Florida Statutes, and Rule 254.016i, Florida Administrative Codet As 
specified above, pursuant to Section 364285, Florida Statuk?~, h e  Commjssion may impose a fm or cancel your certificate. 
Therefore, it is imptanl that you address this matter now. chip _._- 
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If you have paid your fees, please provide . us .. . with _. your . . .. check number and . the .. date that it was paid. 
, . . - . . ''' -----Should you have any questions concerning rhis letter please contact David Brown at (850) 413-6267 or Valorie Moore at 

413-6275 or via Internet e-mail at dbrown@pscstate.ll.us or moor@p-sraie.fl.u5. 
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Enclosure 

u- sc I 6c: David Brown, Bureau of Administrative SeniceslFiscal Services Section 
.,,~ Valorie Moore, Bureau ofAdminishtive ServicesiFiscal Services Section 
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An A f h m t i v e  Actbn I Equal Opportunity Emplore 
PsC Website: http'Jhnm.lkrfdnpr.cnm Intomet E-mall: conart@pmtateAl.us 
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Dorothy Menasco 

From: Paula lsler 
Sent: Thursday, March 03, 2005 4:31 PM 
To : Dorothy Menasco 
Subject: RE: TE920 - Kin Kok Chiu - 

Sl-i 
No, don't open a docket at this' time. The company owes the 2005 RAF unless the letter requestin ca&llatkd 
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provides a date certain the fee will be paid. 

-----Original Message----- 
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From: Dorothy Menasco c2 F 
Sent: Thursday, March 03,2005 4:03 PM 
To: Paula Mer cn 0 
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Subject: TE920 - Kin Kok Chiu 

We have received a payment record of $62 from the above-referenced company. Accompanying letter requests 
cancellation of PATS Cert 3450. How shall 1 proceed? 
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