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(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip)

LINE

NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT

1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) $ =

2. Gross Intrastate Revenue =

3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* ( - )

(see "2. Fees" on back)
4. TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $
(Line 2 less Line 3)

5. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due — (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) ‘58 -

6. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 2-S0

7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) =SV

8. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $..53-55

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50
THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED
9. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered _/
1 O by this Return
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‘ CTR * These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable.
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Company Official)
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! I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a true and
GCL correct statement. Zction 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a public servant in the

[ am aware it pursuant t
| perfornance of his officia) all e Aty of a misdemeanor of the second degree.
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PO Box 690577
Orlando, FL 32869
Ph # (407) 827 0939
Fax # (407) 827 0941

Dale M. Williams, Inc.

March 1, 2005

Florida Public Service Commission

Dear Sir or Madam:

DMW no longer service or own any pay phone in Florida. Please cancel the company’s certificate as
of January 01, 2005. If you have any question please call @ 407-827-0939 x 107.

Sincerely,

AR

. Bela Patel
. Accounting
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Dorothy Menasco

To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: TG628 - Dale M. Williams, Inc.; PATS Cert No. 7240
G o
-
I will not open a new docket based on your information below. Thank you. = B A
o = =
= — T
o i
----- Original Message----- ;%&’3 =
From: Paula Isler € rm T
Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2005 1:46 PM o %,
To: Dorothy Menasco e i

Subject: RE: TG628 - Dale M. Williams, Inc.; PATS Cert No. 7240

Please don't open a docket at this time. They either have to pay 2005 RAF or provide a date certain the RAF
will be paid. 1 need to contact the company. Thanks.

From: Dorothy Menasco

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2005 1:17 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TG628 - Dale M. Williams, Inc.; PATS Cert No. 7240

Hi Paula,

We have received a payment of $53.50 for 2004 RAFs from the above-mentioned company. The attached letter

advises they no longer service or own any pay phones in Florida and requests cancellation of their cert as of
1/1/05. Please advise.

Thanks,
Dorothy



