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Raquel Tully
From: Paulalsler
Sent:  Wednesday, March 30, 2005 10:28 AM
To: Raquel Tully

Subject: RE:

Per Ray Kennedy, all the money goes to the general revenue fund (Docket No. 040062-T1).

From: Raquel Tully
Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2005 4:03 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

| received another check from THLG Carrier for $5000.00. How do you want me to break this down when |

deposit it.
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