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Raquel Tully 
-___-_̂  ~ ._II______ ~ ___^_____. _I_______ l_.___l_.l......_._--l.-_.---. -. ,_--___..I__ lll_ 

From: Paula lsler C&t: \WE: 
Sent: 

To : Raquel Tully 

Wednesday, April 20, 2005 8:33 AM 

Subject: RE: 

Yes. 

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  ~ ...._..._I_______..-______-.____ 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, April 19, 2005 3:13 PM 

Good afternoon. 

Doug just brought over another check for $5000.00 from THLG Carrier, is this to be put towards fines also? 
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