REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(Please Type)

Date: | 5/17/2005 Docket No.: | OEORHA -T1C.

1. Division Name/Staff Name: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/isler

2. OPR: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement

3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counsel

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 4971 by Atlantic Business
Communications of Orlando, inc., effective December 31, 2004.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any):

6. Check one:

Xl Documentation is attached.

[0 Documentation will be provided with recommendation.
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 05/16/2005 at 14:24:44 by PJI

Complete Name: Atlantic Business Communications of Orlando, Inc.

Mailing Name: Atlantic Business Communications of Orlando, Inc.
Company Code: TF869 FEID Number: 59-2978318

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2004 THROUGH 12/31/2004

Reg. Date: 12/11/1996 Inactive Date:

Service: PAT - Pay Telephone

Received: Actual RAF Form

Status: Satisfied

Amended: No Extension: No

Frozen: No Comments: No

Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date

Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00

RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00

Assessment ' Due Paid Owe

RAF $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 ‘ $0.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $50.00 $50.00 $0.00

Last modification was made on Tuesday, January 25, 2005 at 3:35 PM by Valorie Moore

period covered: 01/01/2004 through 12/31/2004 RAF rate: 0.001%
Operating rev: $0.00 Gross intrastate rev: $0.00
Documents: Actual RAF form received on 01/19/2005

RAF form mailed on 12/03/2004

RAF form mailed on 12/01/2004
Postmarked Trans Date Date Posted-By Dep # Check # Check Amount
01/18/2005 01/25/2005 01/25/2005-VPM KG523 10352 $56 .00

RAF paid KG523 $50.00



Paula isler

From: Ray Kennedy

Sent: Tuesday, January 04, 2005 2:07 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: FW: New filing in undocketed matter

————— Original Message-----

From: Matilda Sanders

Sent: Tuesday, January 04, 2005 12:50 PM

To: Susan Howard; Della Fordham; Carclyn Crailg; LaSandra Givens
Subject: New filing in undocketed matter

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = Atlantic Business Communications (Botbol) - Letter dated 12/30/04
advising they would like to cancel PATS cert as of 12/31/04. [Advice regquested from
CMP/Isler on handling.]

DOCUMENT PATH = \5\
file://L:\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\05\00027-05 /@
Document ID = 00027-05 - \K

Document Filed 01/03/05

The filing described above is now available in PDF format, and may also be available in
WordPerfect or other formats.

To access it, click on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows Explorer window.
You will see the PDF (Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also see other versions if they
exist. Double-click on the preferred version and the document will open.

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later when the
reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips on the How To menu.)

You can also go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUMBER, typing ctrl-
C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste the docket number into the query line in CMS.

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary.
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Paula Isler

From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Monday, January 03, 2005 3:59 PM

To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: TF869 (Atlantc Business Communications)
Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Monday, January 03, 2005 3:57 PM

To: Kay Flynn

Subject: RE: TFB862 (Atlantc Business Communications)

Yes. Don't cpen a docket yet. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Monday, January 03, 2005 3:49 PM

To: Paula Isler

Subject: TF869 (Atlantc Business Communications)

Paula, we received a letter from Joel Botbol of this company asking to cancel their PATS
cert as of 12/31/04. No mention of RAF payments. Do you need to contact them?

DN 00027-05

Kay
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o :
Florida Public Service Commission

2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0850

ATTN: Fiscal Services @50 0O 0O

Dear Sir:

I would like to cancel our Pay telephone license, number TF869-04-0-R as
of December 31, 2004. Thank you.

Sincerely,

Botbol

President/CEO
Atlantic Business Communication
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communicatio:

BUSINESSPARTNER

4319 35th Street, Suite E ¢ Orlando, Florida 32811 * (407) 872-1170 * (800) 966-2355  Fax (407) 872-1736



Company Code:
Complete Name:
Mailing Name:
Certificate No(s):
Status:
Regulation Date:
Bankruptc

Company Kiaison #1:

Title:
Mailing Address:

Physical Location:

Phone:
Fax:
Related Dockets:

961044-TC

MCD Company Information for TF869

Printed on 01/06/2005 at 10:50:53 by PJI

TEF869

Atlantic Business Communications of Orlando, Inc.
Z\;%aantic Business Communications of Orlando, Inc.
Active

12/11/19%96

No

Joel D. Botbol

President

4319 35th Street, Suite E

Orlando, FLL 32811-6501
4319 35th Street. Suite E

Orlando, FL 32811-6501
é407; 872-1170
407) 872-1736

Application for certificate to provide telephone service by

a
Atlantic Business Communications o? grlan o, Inc.





