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4. Suggested Docket Title: 

REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET 
(Please Type) 

Request for cancellation of CLEC Certificate No. 7922 by NTERA, Inc., effective August 1, 

Date: 911 9/2O05 
I 

I. Division NamelStaff Name: 1 Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcementllsler 

2. OPR: I Division Of Competitive Markets 8, Enforcement 
~ ~- -: 3. OCR. I Office Of The General Counsel 

~ ~ ~~ ~~ ~~~ 

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary) 

A. 

6. 

Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.) 

I. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

I 

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any): 

6. Check one: 

Documentation is attached. 

0 Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 
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Paula M e r  

From: Pauta lsler 

Sent: 

To: 'JCruzBustillo@aol.com' 

Subject: RE: Ntera, Inc. 

-II____ .- -I -__ll---.---.lll 

Thursday, August 18,2005 3121 PM 

Good afternoon. 

I wanted to get back with you and let you know the status of your inquiry from Friday. I just checked our records 
and we still have not received payment of the 2004 Regulatory Assessment Fee, including past due penalty and 
interest charges, for NTEW's tXC certificate (TJ543). We did, as confirmed in our previous telephone 
conversation, receive NTERA's payment of $12.50 for its CLEC certificate (TX579). I will continue to hold the 
request for cancellation until payment is received. Let me know if you have any questions. 

Paula lsler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 41 3-6502-Phone 
(850) 41 3-6503-Fax 
P I slgr@ psc-state I fl .us 

From: JCruzBustillo@aol.com [mailto:3CruzBustillo@aof.com] 
Sent: Friday, August 12, 2005 6:16 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Cc: PTurner@nteraholdings.com 
Subject: Ntera, Inc. 

Paula, 

We would like to confirm to you that final payment was sent for Ntera's CLEC cancellation (TX-579) balance of 
$12.50. In addition, Ntera's IXC 2004 regulatory assessment fee return was mailed together with the balance due 
of $73.00 (this certificate will remain active). 

Should you require any additional information please forward. Thank you in advance for your attention to this 
matter. 

Sincerely, 
Jacq uel in e C ru z- Bu s t i I lo 

81 1 8/2005 
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Paula lsler 

From: 

Sent: 
To: 

Subject: 

Every thing 

Raquel Tully 

Monday, August 15,2005 9:ll AM 

Paula lsler 

RE: Ntera, Inc. 

is posted to the Raf system, except this deposit I am working on and it is not in this deposit. 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Monday, August 15,2005 9:09 AM 
To: Raquel Tully 
Subject: RE: Ntera, Inc. 

OK. Can you tet me know if you receive the payment for $73 for TJ543? Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, August 15,2005 8:45 AM 
To: Paula Mer 
Subject: RE: Ntera, Inc. 

$12.50 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Monday, August 15,2005 8:42 AM 
To: Raquel Tully 
Subject: RE: Ntera, Inc. 

How much was the check for? 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, August 15,2005 8:41 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: RE: Ntera, Inc. 

We received payment for TX579, I am doing a deposit this morning, and have made your copies.. I don't see 
anything on TJ543 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Monday, August 15,2005 8:27 AM 
To: Raquel Tully 
Subject: FW: Ntera, Inc. 

Good morning Raquel. See this company's question below. RAF System does not reflect payment yet. Please 
let me know if we've received NT€RA's payment for TX579 and TJ543. Thanks. 

lllll_n-lll~__l-"ll"- _ll-l_~l-,--l-lll"-lll.-l_l-" 

From: JCruz8ustillo@aol.com [mailto:JCruzBustillo@aol.com] 
Sent: Friday, August 12, 2005 6 3 6  PM 
To: Paula Isler 

8/15/2005 
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Cc: PTurner@nteraholdings.com 
Subject: Ntera, Inc. 

Paula, 

We would like to confirm to you that final payment was sent for Ntera's CLEC cancellation (TX-579) balance of 
$1 2.50. In addition, Ntera's IXC 2004 regulatory assessment fee return was mailed together with the balance due 
of $73.00 (this certificate will remain active). 

Should you require any additional information please forward. Thank you in advance for your attention to this 
matter. 

Sincerely, 
Jacq uel in e C r uz-B us t i I Io 

8/15/2005 



*\ bl;\>..Sb 
COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 

Assessment 

RAF 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension Fee 

Printed on 08/15/2005 qt: 07:47:14 by RRT 

ii 4 LJ -7 ,”, / 1 Complete Name: NTERA, Inc. 
I LpiJ 2.Sa~ J Y I _  . I  - 

Mailing Name: NTERA, Inc. 
Company Code: TX579 FEID Number: 65-1087859 SQS 

Due Paid Owe 

$ 5 0  - 0 0  $ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

$ 2 . 5 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $2.50 . 

$0 - 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $0.00 

$ 0 . 5 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $0.50 

e% O S  RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2002 THROUGH 12/31/2002 

R e g .  Date: 1 0  /19 /2 0 0 1 Inactive Date: 
Service : 
Received: Actual RAF Form 
S t a t u s :  Pending 

Fl70zeIL: No Comments  : 
Payment Count: 1 Payment Mads t o  D a t e  

Operating R e v :  $ 0 . 0 0  Interstate Rev: 
RAF R a t e :  0 . 0 0 1 5  Net RAF Due: 

CLX - Competitive Local Exchange 

A m e n d e d :  No E x t e n s i o n :  NO 

No 

$ 0 . 0 0  

$50  - 0 0  

Last: modification was made on Wednesday, February 1 9 ,  2 0 0 3  a t  8:59 AM by Jackie Knight 



I .  

r-, 

Assessment 

RAP 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension Fee 

Total 

COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 

Owe D u e  Paid 
$ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

$1.00 $ 0 . 0 0  $1.00 % 

$ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $0.00 

$ 5 . 0 0  $0.00  $ 5 . 0 0  

$ 5 6 . 0 0  $ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 6 . 0 0  

Company Code: ~ ~ 5 7 9  FEID Number: 65-1087859 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2003 THROUGH 12/31/2003 8-9- 0s 
R e g .  Date: 10/19/2001 Inactive D a t e :  
Service : 
Received: Actual RAE' Form 
S t a t u s :  Pending 

Amended : No Extension: 
Frozen: No Comments: 
Payment Count: 1 Payment'Made to D a t e  

Operating Rev: $ 0 . 0 0  Interstate Rev: 
0.0015 Net RAF D u e :  RAF Rate: 

CLX - Competitive Local Exchange 

NO 
No 

$ 0 . 0 0  

$ 5 0 . 0 0  

(cr 

1 



COMPANY fDENT3FICATION 
Printed on 08/15/2005 at 07:46:55 by RRT 

Assessment 

RAP 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension F e e  

Total 

C o m p l e t e  Name: NTERA, Inc. 

Due P a i d  Owe 

$ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

$ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

$ 6 5 .  SO $ 6 2 . 0 0  $3 .50  

$12.50 $12.00 $ 0 . 5 0  ~ 

$3.00 $ 0 . 0 0  $ 3 . 0 0  

Mailing Name:  ERA, fne. 
Company Code: TX579 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE 

R e g .  D a t e :  10/19/2001 

's .00'5 
PERIOD 01/01/2004 THROUGH 12/31/2004 

Service: 

Received: Actual RAF Form 

CLX - Competitive Local Exchange 

- 

Inactive Date: 

Status : Pending 
No 
No 

Amended : NO Extension: 
Frozen: No Comments : 
Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to D a t e  
Operating Rev: 

RAF Rate: 0.0015 

$ 0 . 0 0  Interstate Rev: 
Net RAF Due: 

$ 0 - 0 0  

$ 5 0 . 0 0  
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Paula lsler 
__-- ll__l-llllllll--- .-I_ --_l_____l__----..----”__II_ .IIc--.pp--.--llll 

From: JCruzBustillo@aol.com 

Sent: 

To: Paula Mer 

Cc: PTurner@nteraholdings.com 

Subject: Re: Netel and Radiant Telecom cancellation of IXC certificates 

Tuesday, August 02,2005 456 PM 

Paula, 

Thank you for responding. I have processed these balances for payment. You should receive them shortly. 

Thank you for your attention to this matter. 

S in cerei y , 
Jacqueline Cruz-Bustilto 

8/3/2005 
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Paula lsler 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 

To: 

Cc: 

Subject: RE: Netel and Radiant Telecom cancellation of IXC certificates 

Tuesday, August 02,2005 4:49 PM 

'J CruzBust iI lo@aol .com' 

PTu rner@n tera h old ings .com 

Dear Ms. Cruz-Bustillo: 

Yes, I received the letters and will open a docket to cancel NETEL, Inc.3 IXC certificate (TJ721) and Radiant 
Telecom, Inc.'s IXC certificate (TJ230). 

In addition, I've received the letter from Mr. Turner requesting cancellation of NTERA's CLEC certificate (TX579). 
However, payment of the past due ClEC balance ($12.50) was not received. Also, we did not receive NTERA's 
payment of the $7.00 IXC balance nor the IXC's 2004 RAF plus late payment charges. The docket for NTERA 
will not be opened at this time until payment is received. 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Paula lsler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 41 3-6502-Phone 
(850) 41 3-6503-Fax 
Flsler@psc.state.fl .us 

From: JCruzBustillo@aol.com [mailto:JCruzBustillo@aol.comj 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02, 2005 4:22 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Cc: PTurner@nteraholdings.com 
Subject: Netel and Radiant Telecom cancellation of IXC certificates 

Paula, 

In following up with the cancellation of the above referenced entities certificate with the Florida PSC, please 
confirm if you have received the original signed letters requesting the cancellation of their IXC certificates. 

Furthermore, should you require any additional information please let me know. You can reach me at 305-467- 
551 9. 

Sincerely, 
Jacqueline Cruz-Bustillo 

8/2/2 005 



Paul D. Turner 
General Counsel 
Direct Dial: 305.914.3360 
phrmer@,,nteraholdinFis.com 

July 28,2005 

VIA US MAIL 

Florida Public Service Commission 
Attn.: Ms. Paula Isler 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850 

Re: NTERA,mC. 
TX579 

Dear Ms. Mer: 

This correspondence shall serve as Ntera, Inc.’s (“Ntera”) request to cancel its 
CLEC certificate with the Florida Public Service Commission. Additionally, Ntera 
previously submitted its 2004 and 2005 regulatory assessment fee returns with payments 
as required to cancel the certificate. 

Should you have any additional questions please feel free to contact Jacqueline 
Cmz-Bustillo at 305-467-55 19. 
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Paula lsler 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 

To: 'J CruzB ustillo@aol .corn' 
Subject: RE: NTERA, Inc. (TX579) 

_II_ __I_-- 1_-111111_- 

Thursday, July 28, 2005 8:21 AM 

Good morning. Yes, I will need the original letter (with an original signature). As soon as the letter and payment 
of $85 ($12.50 CLEC batance, $7.00 IXC balance, and $65.50 IXC 2004 RAF plus late payment charges) are 
received, I'll open a docket to handle the voluntary cancellation. Concerning the IXC, if the company had zero 
revenues (or revenues of $33,333 or less), NTERA would owe $65.50, which includes the minimum $50 fee plus 
$12.50 penalty and $3+00 interest if payment is postmarked by July 30th. If payment is postmarked between July 
31st and August 29th, the interest goes up to $3.50, or $66.00 total. Thanks for your help. 

Paula lsler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tailahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 41 3-6502-Phone 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
P Isler@psc. state.fl . us 

.-_ ~ . - - r  ---_- 

From: JCruzBustiIlo@aol.com [mailto:JCruzBustillo@aol.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2005 5:20 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: Re: NTERA, Inc. (TX579) 

Paula, 

Thank you for the attached. I was away on vacation, therefore please excuse my late reply. I thought a letter 
requesting cancellation was included. (Please see attached). Nonetheless, I know you will require an original 
and I will get the attached letter signed and mailed to you directly. 

I will also include the attached pending fees. In reference to Ntera's IXC TJ543, please verify the 2004 fees, 
penalties and interest so I can include with the above. 

If there are any additional pending matters please do not hesitate to contact me by e-mail or at 305-467-551 9. 

Thank you for your attention to this matter. 

Sincerely, 
Jacq uel ine C ru z-Bus ti lo 

7/28/2005 



June 2,2005 

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 
Ms. Paula lsler 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850 

Ref: NTERA, INC. 
TX579 

Dear Ms. Isler: 

We would like to cancel NTERA, INC.’s CLEC certificate with the Florida Public 
Service Commission under ID# TX579. At the same time, we are remitting t he  
2004 and 2005 regulatory assessment fee returns with payments as required to 
cancel the certificate. 

Should you have any additional questions please feel free to contact Jacqueline 
Cruz-Bustillo at 305-467-551 9. 

S i nce re I y , 

Paul Turner 
General Counsel 
NTERA, INC. 



Paula Mer 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

- 

Paula lsler 
Friday, July 22, 2005 3:OO PM 
'jcruzbustillo@aol.com' 
NTERA, Inc. (TX579) 

D e a r  Ms. Cruz-Bustillo: 

The payment for NTERA's CLEC certificate for 2004  and 2005 was postmarked July 16th. When 
we t a lked  on June 2nd, you had said that the company would probably request cancellation 
of its CLEC certificate (and keep its IXC active). The payment d i d  NOT include a letter 
requesting cancellation. In order to go forward, if that is what the company wants, we 
must receive a letter requesting cancellation, which includes an explantation of why it 
wishes to cancel its CLEC certificate (such as never started operations or no longer in 
the business), and include a check f o r  the past due amount of $12.50, which is the balance 
of $3 .00  for late payment of the 2002 Regulatory Assessment Fee, $6.00 fo r  late payment of 
the 2003  Regulatory Assessment Fee, and $3.50 for late payment of the 2004 Regulatory 
Assessment Fee. In addition, the company's IXC Certificate (TJ543) has a balance of $7.00 
($1.00, $ 3 . 0 0 ,  and $3.00 for late payments of the 2001, 2002,  and 2003 fees, respectively) 
plus owes the 2004 fee, penalty and interest. Staff could not recommend approval of one 
certificate with outstanding fees on another.  

I j u s t  wanted to let you know that a docket will not be established until the company 
writes a letter requesting cancellation and pays all outstanding f e e s  for both 
certificates. Please let me know if you have any questions. Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850 ) 4 13 - 65 02 -Phone 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
PIsler@psc.state.fl.us 

1 



ZOMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 07/27/2005 at 14:27:54 by P S I  

As s es smen t 

RAF 

Complete Name: NTERA, Inc. 

D u e  Paid Owe 

$ 5 0 . 0 0  $SO. 00 $0 I O 0  

Mailing Name: NTERA, Inc.  
Company Code: TX579 FEID Number:  65-1087859 

Penalty 

Interest 

E x t e n s i o n  Fee 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2005 THROUGH 12/31/2005 

$0.00 $0 * 00 $0.00 

$ 0 . 0 0  $0 L 0 0  $0.00 

$ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

Reg. Date: 
Service : 
R e c e i v e d :  

S t a t u s :  

Amended: 
Frozen: 
Payment C o u n t :  
Operating Rev: 
RAF Rate: 

10/19/2001 

CLX - Competitive 
A c t u a l  RAF Form 
Satisfied 
No 
No 
1 Payment Made to 

$ 0  - 
0 . 0 0 2 0  

Inactive Date: 

Local Exchange 

Extension: 
Comments : 

D a t e  

00 Interstate Rev: 
Net RAF Due: 

No 
No 

$ 0 . 0 0  

$ 5 0 . 0 0  

~~ I T o t a l  I $50.00 I $ 5 0 1 0 7 T  $0.00 I 
~~ 

Last modification was made on Wednesday, July 20, 2005 at 11:58 AM by D a v i d  Brown 

NTERA, INC. (TX5.79) 
Industry: Telecommunications, Service provided: CLX 
Company t y p e :  Alternative Local Exchange Companies 
Regulation date:  10/19/2001, Inactive date: 
Certificate number: 7922, County: 

Company liaison: Mike Vazquez, President 
Mailing address: Location address: 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 1020 N.W. 163rd D r i v e  

Miami, FL 33169-5818 Miami, FL 33169-5818 

E-mail address: mikejr@ntera.net 
Web site:  http://www.ntera.net 
Phone number: (305) 914-3452 
Fax number: ( 3 0 5 )  914-3453 

Per iod  covered: 01/01/2005 through 12/31/2005 RAF rate: 0.002C 

Operating rev : $0 - 00 Gross in t ras ta te  rev :  s o  O C  

Documents :  Actual PAF form received on 07/16/2005 
Postmarked Trans  Eate Date Posted-By Dep it Check # Check Amount 
07/16/2005 0 7 / 2 0 / 2 0 0 5  07/20/2005-DBR LA572 3 2 0 3  $ 5 0 . 0 0  

RAF paic LA5 7 s  $ 5 C .  OC 

i 



ZOMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 07/27/2005 at 14:27:48 by P J I  

Assessment 

RAF 

Complete Name: NTERA, Inc. 

Due Paid Owe 
$ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

Mailing Name: NTERA, Inc. 
Company Code: TX579 FEID Number: 65-1087859 

Assessment 

RAF 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2004 THROUGH 12/31/2004 

Due Paid Owe 
$ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 5 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

Reg. Date: 
Service: 
Received: 

Status: 
Amended: 
Frozen: 
Payment Count: 
Operating Rev: 
RAF Rate: 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension F e e  

Total 

10/19/2001 Inactive Date: 
CLX - Competitive Local Exchange 
Actua l  RAF Form 

Pending 
No Extension: No 
No Comments : No 
1 Payment Made to D a t e  

$ 0 . 0 0  Interstate Rev: 
0.0015 Net RAF D u e :  

$12.50 $12 IO0 $0-50 

$3.00 $0.00 $3.00 

$0 I O 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

$ 6 5 . 5 0  $62.00 $3.50 

$ 0 . 0 0  

$50 .00  

_ _  

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension F e e  

Total 

$12.50 $12 IO0 $0-50 

$3.00 $0.00 $3.00 

$0 I O 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  

$ 6 5 . 5 0  $62.00 $3.50 

L a s t  modification w a s  made on Wednesday, July 20, 2005 at 11:58 AM by David Brown 

N T E m ,  INC. (TX579) 
Industry: Telecommunications, Service provided: CLX 
Company t y p e :  Alternative Local Exchange Companies 
Regulation date :  10/19/2001, Inactive date: 
Certificate number: 7922, County: 
Company l i a i s o n :  Mike Vazquez, President 
Mailing address: Location address: 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 1020 N . W .  163rd Drive 
Miami, FL 33169-5818 Miami, FL 33169-5818 

E-mail address: mikejr@ntera.net 
web site: http://www.ntera.net 
Phone number: (305) 9 1 4 - 3 4 5 2  

Fax number: ( 3 0 5 )  9 1 4 - 3 4 5 3  

Period covered: 01/01/2004 through 12/31/2004 RAF ra te :  0.0015 

Operating rev : $0.00 G r o s s  i n t r a s t a t e  rev: $ 0 . 0 0  

Documents: A c t u a l  FAF form received on 07/16/2005 
Delinquent letter mailed on 0 2 / 1 6 / 2 0 0 5  

RAF form maiied on 12/0l/2004 
Postmarked Trans Da te  Date Posted-By DeF ti Check f Check Amount 
0 7 / 1 5 / 2 0 0 5  0 7 / 2 0 / 2 0 C 5  07/20/2005-DBR L4572 3 2 2 E  $ 6 2 . 0 0  

M F  paid LA5’7i $56.00 

P e n a l t y  palo LA572 $12. o c  

I 



Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula Mer 
Thursday, June 02,2005 4:21 PM 
'jcruzbustillo@aol xom' 
RAF Form 

Attachments: RAF-TX579-05-0-R.pdf 

RAF-TX579-05- 
0-R.pdf (27 KB) 

This e-mail was sent from The F lo r ida  Public Service Commission's Regulatory 
Assessment Fee (RAF) S y s t e m .  

Attached document t y p e :  Adobe Portable Document Format ( P D F )  

1 



TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES. THE REGL <Y ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/3( 

Competitive Local Exchange Company Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

STATUS: 

Actual Return 
Estimated Return 
Amended Return 

- 
- 
- 
PERIOD COVERED: 
01/01/2005 TO 12/31/2005 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(Sce FiIing Instructions on Back of Form) 

TX579-05-0-R 
NTERA, Inc. 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 
Miami, FL 33169-5818 

I 
Please Complete Below If Omcia1 Mailing Address Has Changed 

I FOR PSC USE ONLY 

ICheck # 

$ 06-03 -00 I 
00300 1 

$ P 
06-03-00 1 

0040 I 1 

$ I 

Postmark Date 
Initials of Preparer 

(Name of Company) (Address) (CitylState) (Zip) 

LINE 
NO. 

I ,  
2. 
3. 
4. 
5 .  
6 .  

7. 
8. 

9. 
10. 
11. 
12. 
13. 

14. 

FLORIDA GROSS 
ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION OPERATING REVENUE INTRASTATE REVENUE 

Basic Local Services 
Long Distance Services (IntraLATA only)‘’) 
Access Services 
Private Line Services 
Leased Facilities & Circuits Services 
Miscellaneous Services 

$ s 

TOTAL REVENUES $ 
LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies‘” 

NET INTRASTATE OPERATING REVENUE for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation (Line 7 less Line 8) $ 
Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 9 by 0.0020) 
Penalty for Late Payment (see “3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back) 
Interest for Late Payment (see “3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back) 
Extension Payment Fee (see “4. Extension ‘I on back) 

(3) TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ($50 MINIMUM} $ 

( 1 )  Other long distance revenue must be listed on the Interexchange Regulatory Assessment Fee Retum. 
(2) These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable (see “2. Fees” on back). 
(3) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimum annuaI regulatory assessment fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in 

Section 364.336, Florida Statutes. 

CURRENT COMPANY STATUS 
( ) Facilities-Based Provider ( ) Reseller 

( ) Other: 

BILLING INFORMATION 
Complete below if billing agent is other than yourself. 

0 
(Name) (Address: CitylStatelZip) (Telephone) 

COMPANY INFORMATION 
Do you lease telecommunications’ facilities? ( ) YES ( 1 NO 
EYES, who do you lease these facilities from? Name: 

Address: 

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above 
information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with 
the intent to mislead a public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree, 

(Signature of Company Official) (Title) (Date) 

TelephoneNumber ( ) Fax Number ( ) 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

F.E,I. No. 

PSC/CMP 007 (Rev. 01/05) 



MCD Company Information for TX579 

Printed on 09/19/2005 at 09:30:36 by PJI 

Company Code: 
Complete Name: 
Mailing Name: 
Certificate No@): 
Status: 
Regulation Date: 
Bankruptc 
Company iaison #1: 
Title: 
Mailing Address: 

E: 

Physic a1 Loc at ion : 

Phone: 
Fax: 

Related Dockets: 

01 0654-TX 

02 063 4-TX 

TX579 
NTERA, Inc. 
NTERA, Inc. 
7922 
Active 
10/19/2001 
No 
Mike Vazquez 
President 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 

Miami, FL 33169-5818 
1020 N.W. 163rd Drive 

Miami, FL 33169-5818 

Application for certificate to rovide alternative local exchange 
telecommunications service .& y NTERA, Inc. 

Cancellation by Florida Public Service Commission of ALEC 
Certificate No. 7922 issued to NTERA, h c .  for violation of Rule 
25-4.01 61, F.A.C., Regulatory Assessment Fees; Telecommunications 
C ompani es . 

1 


