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Raquel Tully

From: Ray Kennedy

Sent:  Friday, November 18, 2005 12:25 PM Sy O
Crmypss §ooapir ! e
To: Ragquel Tully LIFUST b e
i IR
Subject: RE: 600 NGV ¢ 172005

General Revenue Fund

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2005 11:20 AM
To: Ray Kennedy

Subject:

| received the check for $15,000.00. It apparently came in after 4:.00 yesterday. How do you want the money
Deposited.
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NCIC Operator Services
1809 Judson Rd.
Longview, TX 75605
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