
From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 
To : Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: 

Monday, August 07,2006 10:14 AM 
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From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, August 07, 2006 9:48 AM 
To: Paula Isler a1 2 

i72 - n'7 c c-3 Subject: RE: 
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the company name for Docket 060466, is New Century Telecom They just sent in a check -cj (r m -- TI 7 YJ C? 
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Sent: Monday, August 07, 2006 9:46 AM pQ f ' i Z  
To: Raquel Tully m c7 
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- 7  .. 0 -  --_ From: Paula Isler 

Subject: RE: 

1. TJ623 is Easton Telecom Services, L.L.C. The $38.27 is for past due P&l ($12.90 for 2003 and $25.37 for 2005) and should be 
deposited as you normally would. Please deposit $200 in the PSC Trust Fund for collection costs and the balance of $300 in the 
General Revenue Fund. Please provide Records proof of payment for Docket No. 060466-TI. 

2. I need more information on the $500 check for Docket No. 060466-TI (either a company code or company name). 
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From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, August 07, 2006 9:19 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Su bject: 

I left these out 
TJ623 $538.27 
Docket 060466 for $500.00 
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