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CLERK
TO: DIVISION OF THE COMMISSION CLERK AND ADMINISTRATIVE
SERVICES
FROM: OFFICE OF THE GENERAL COUNSEL (GERVASI) f ¢ G x

DOCKET NO. 060122-WU — PETITION FOR APPROVAL OF REVISED
TARIFF SHEETS FOR UNDERGROUND RESIDENTIAL DISTRIBUTION
SERVICE, BY TAMPA ELECTRIC COMPANY.

Attached is a copy of a letter addressed to Mr. Steve Watford and dated November 29,
2006 to be filed in the above-referenced docket.
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FREDERICK L. ARCHAUER, JR-
Crris H. BEnTLEY, PA.
Rogerr C. BRANNAN

Dayip F. CHESTER

E. MAnsHALL DETERDING
Joun R, Jenkms, PA.,
Steven T, Minous, RA.
Cuasiry H. O’StEun
Darey L 5uepy

ROSE s SUNDSTROM, BENTLEY, LLP > 4136225

Law Qpricss

RosE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2548 B1ARsTONE PiNEs DRIVE
TaLiaHasstr, Fuorioa 32301
(530) 8776555
Fax (850) 656-4029
www, shillormeys.com
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SaNLANDO CEnTER

2180 West STATE Roan 434
Sume 2118

Lonowoon, Froroa 32779
(407) 830-6331

Fax (407) 830-8522

Winizam E- BunpstroM. BA.
Duxe D, TREMOR, PA,
Jomn L. WiaToN MART™N 5. FriomaN, RA.
—_ . VALERIE L. LorD

Ropert M. G, Rose, (1924-2006) - * Brun J. STReRT

TELECOPY COVER SHEET

DATE:. Decembar 1, 2006 OUR FILE NO.:_26038.49

PAGES:__

TO: Rosanne Gervasi "TELECOPY NUMBER: 413-6225

FROM: F. Marshall Deterding  CONTACT PERSON: Tonva
SUBJECT: Aloha Utilities, Inc.

- MESSAGE:

Please notify us immediately if not received properly:
(850) §77-6555 ‘

The information contained in this transmission is attorney privileged and confidential. It is
intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If the reader of this message
is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copy
of this communication is strictly prohibited. [f you have received this communication in error,
please notify us immediately by telephone collect and remurn the original message 10 us at the
above address via the U. S. Postal Service. We will reimburse you for postage. Thank you.
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PASCO COUNTY, FLORIDA

Via Faesimile (727) 372-2677

Novamber 28, 2006

or 3.1 milion gaflons (mg) of fmited bulk potable water supply, the required impact fee

is §$4,924 571, if paid on or before December 19, 2006. This 8 based on the rates and demand

basi forth in the 2004 Bulk Water Agreement with Alboha Utifities ("Aloha”). Pasco County

agrees fo refiund fo Aloha any porlion of the impact fees paid fo the County 1o the extent Aloha

ultimately does not requine the water paid for by that portion of the impact fees. There will be no

obﬁgabgd tha County o make such refund to Aloha of a portion of the impact fees pakd

until Aloha provides a written request for such refund, inclixding a release of Pasco

Courtly's obkgation to provide the warter associated with the refunded kopact fees andd the Board
of County Commissioners authorizes payment

Paseo County commifts 1o supply to Alcha the quanties and phases of water reserved
by Akmia upon the payment of tha cument impant fees on or before December 18, 2008, The
various phases of waber shiall be supplied st the agreed fhree locafions beginning on future
dates and agreed 1 by e County and Alcha  The County shall supply the
mmmmmmmmmMmmummﬁms
emalbwlassﬁ‘mmavemgemml daily defvery of 2.1 myg dstributed over the thiee
! connaciion polls as folows: 1.8 mg at Marathon; 0.9 mg at Litle Road; and 0.4 mg at

anmd. Ta the extent the rate of defivery within a 24 hour period is greater, the Coundy may

capital conibutions, The County has prepared a prefivirary estimate which

requn Aloha to pay an additional capital condribution to the countty of $2.72 million to provide

theqmmmesofwatermaméaybammanaﬁmmlsﬁmmnfuamofs1172
milfion !f provide the water on a peak hour basis.
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Please fee! free to call me if vou have any questions.

Sincerely,
A*{?'“_7 e
T e
Bruce E. Kennedy, P.E.
Assistaht County Administrator
Utilities {Sarvices Branch

cc.  Stephen C. Reilty, Office of Public Counsel
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