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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 
To : Raquel Tully 

cc:  Kiwanis Curry; Ray Kennedy 

Subject: RE: Docket No. 06061 9-TX 

Monday, February 05,2007 1 1 :I 3 AM 

Please deposit all $500 in the  General Revenue Fund and provide proof of payment to Records so that it can documented in Docket 
No. 060619-TX. Just as information, the company will be making seven $500 monthly payments. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, February 05, 2007 10:43 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

I received a check for $500.00 for Docket 60619-TX., pleas please me know how you would like me to deposit this 

ET- 

2/5/2007 
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