REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(Please Type)

Date: 4/30/2007 Docket No.: 01 Q ;LM -TC

1. Division Name/Staff Name: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/Isler

2. OPR: | Division Of The Commission Clerk And Administrative Services

3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counse!

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 7822 by Bruce D. Bahret, effective April

23, 2007.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any):

o
:i
6. Check one: {
X Documentation is attached.
[0 Documentation will be provided with recommendation.
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Tuesday, Apr 24, 2007 11:53 AM



Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, April 24, 2007 11:51 AM

To: ‘bbahret@msn.com’

Subject: FW: Business cessation

Attachments: TG808-2006 Balance Due.pdf; RAF-TG808-07-0-R.pdf

TG808-2006 RAF-TG808-07-
ance Due.pdf (8-R.pdf (122 KB

Dear Mr. Bahret:

There are two kinds of cancellation. One is voluntary, which is when a certificate holder
pays any past due and current Regulatory Assessment Fees, and leaves in good standing.

The second type of cancellation is involuntary and is when a certificate is cancelled on
the Commission's own motion for vioclation of a rule, order, or statute. The Regulatory
Assessment Fee is applicable if a certificate is active for any day during a calendar
year.

In this case, you owe a $6 penalty and interest charge for late payment of the 2006 fee
(payment was due by January 30th; payment was postmarked March 15th, and the 2007 minimum
fee of $100 for a total due of $106.

I am attaching a breakdown of the late payment charge and the 2007 Regulatory Assessment
Fee return form which should be completed and returned with full payment. Please respond
by May 9, 2007. Let me know if you have any questions.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax
PIsler@psc.state.fl.us

----- Original Message-----

From: Rick Moses

Sent: Tuesday, April 24, 2007 10:41 AM
To: Paula Isler

Cc: Ray Kennedy

Subject: FW: Business cessation

Please handle. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Beth Salak

Sent: Tuesday, April 24, 2007 10:41 AM
To: Rick Moses

Subject: FW: Business cessation

————— Original Message-----

From: Rhonda Hicks

Sent: Tuesday, April 24, 2007 7:52 AM
To: Beth Salak

Subject: FW: Business cessation



Rhonda L. Hicks
(850) 413-6449

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth McHargue

Sent: Monday, April 23, 2007 4:43 PM
To: Rhonda Hicks

Subject: FW: Business cessation

————— Original Message-----

From: Consumer Contact

Sent: Monday, April 23, 2007 3:13 PM
To: Ruth McHargue

Subject: FW: Business cessation

To CMP

————— Original Message-----

From: BRUCE BAHRET [mailto:bbahret@msn.com]
Sent: Monday, April 23, 2007 12:11 PM

To: Consumer Contact

Subject: Business cessation

I will no longer be providing payphone services in Florida.

certificate #7822.
Thank you.

Bruce D. Bahret

Please deactivate my



Company Code:
Complete Name:
Mailing Name:
Certificate No(s):
Status:
Regulation Date:
Bankruptc

Company Kiaison #1:

Title:
Mailing Address:

Physical Location:

Phone:
Fax:
Related Dockets:

010467-TC

MCD Company Information for TG808

Printed on 04/24/2007 at 11:51:37 by PJI

TGR0R

Bruce D. Bahret

Bruce D. Bahret

7822

Active

05/30/2001

No

Bruce D. Bahret

Owner

5640 Sheffield Greene Circle

Sarasota, FL. 34235-2429
5640 Sheffield Greene Circle

Sarasota, FL 34235-2429
041) 341-9824
041) 341-9825

Application for certificate to provide pay telephone service by

Bruce D. Bahret.



