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ATIORNEYS AT lAW 

March 10, 2016 

VIA E-FILl 

arlolla . tauffer, ommission lcrk 
ffice of ommission Jerk 

Florida Public ervice ommi sion 
2540 humard Oak Boulevard 
l allaha ·ee, FL 32399 

RI::.: ; Application for limited proceeding water rate increa e in Marion, Pasco, 
and eminole ounties, by tilitie , Inc. of I· lorida. 

ur File o. 30057.224 

Dear Ms. Lauffer: 

I he following are the respon ·es of Utilitic ·, Inc. of 1- lorida, ("Utility") to the tarrs econdt Data 
Request dated FebruarJ 25, 20 16: 

I. 1 he folio' ing items relate to the tilit) 's requested rate case e pen e. 
a) For each indi idual per on , in each finn providing consulting er ices to the applicant 
pertaining to thi docket, provide the billing rate and an itemized description of work perfonned. 
Plea e provide detail of hour " orked a ociated with each activity. Also, provide a description and 
as ociated cost for all e penses incurred to date. 

Response: ce ttachment "2- 1 ". 

b) For each finn or consultant providing services for the applicant in U1is docket, please pro ide 
copies of all invoices for services provided to date. 

Response: ee Attachment "2- 1 " . 

c) If rate consultant invoice are not broken down b) hour, please provide report that detail by 
hour a de cription of actual dutie perfonned, and amount incurred to date. 
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d) Please pro' ide an estimate of costs to complete the case by hour for each consultant or 
employee, including a de cription of estimated work to be performed, and detail of the estimated 
remaining expense to be incurred through the Limited Proceeding proces . 

Response: ee Atlachment "2- 1 " . 

e) Please provide an itemiLed li t of all other cost estimated to be incurred through the Limited 
Proceeding process. 

Respon e: ee Attachment "2- 1 ". I he in-hou e e\.penses are unchanged from the original chedule 
B- 1 0, except to add the out ide co ts for copying the MFRs in the amount of I 03.09, and that 
lmoice is included in this attachment. 

2. Do the current rates presented on chedule No. 13, olumn (b), include a gross-up for rcgulatof) 
as es ment fees for Marion, Pa co Pha e I II, and eminole? 

Respon e: The rates included in olumn (b) are the currently appro ed rate for each ounty. 
l hesc rate were appro ed for lrs last index and pass-through application. The index and pass­
through appl icati on calculation included a gross-up for regulatory assessment fees. 

3. Plea e provide the Pasco ounty water utility e penses for 2015 in the same format as chedules 
W- IO(a) and W- lO(b) u ed in the Ia "A" or "B" Annual Report . 

Respon e: Please see Attachment "2-3" which are chedules W- IO(a) and W- IO(b) for Pa co 
County. Please note that the e chedules include allocated o erhead from our parent company. 
Also, the number in the chedule have not been finalized b} our orporate ffice . 

4. Plea e indicate on the 20 15 chedules W- lO(a) and W- IO(b) which e ·penes are being eliminated 
or reduced as a result of the abandonment of the wells in Pasco County. 

Response: ·r he fo lio\ ing water utility expense accounts are impacted by the abandonment of the 
four ummertree' ell s: 615, purcha ed power; 618, chemicals; 620, materials and supplies, 635, 
contractual services testing; 659, Insurance; 675 Misc. expense. 

5. Plea e pro ide a justification for retaining each e\.pense that is not totally eliminated in olumn (d) 
" . I ource of upply and 1:: penses perations,'' olumn (e) " .2 ource of upply and 

Fxpen es Maintenance," olumn (f) ".3 Water I reatment Expenses perations," and olumn 
(g) " .4 Water Treatment pen e Maintenance" as shown on the 20 15 chedules W- I O(a) and 
W- I O(b) for Pasco County. 
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Response: As noted in the tility's March 2, 2016 respon e to ltem 20 o f OP 's Is ues and 
Concerns Request, the abandonment of the ummertree wells is not expected to result in any 
decrea e in manpower. I he same number of field tafT ' ill be employed therea fter in order to 
comply with applicable FDI::P rules and regulations regarding the operation, maintenance and repair 
of the v ater distribution and wa te-. ater co llection systems, to respond to alarms and abnormal 
e ents at any ti me, to rcsp nd to customer requests and inquiries, and othen\ i e maintain the 
Utility's infrastructure throughout its sy tern located in Pasco and Pinellas counties. fhus, no 
reduction in annual operati ng e pense is to occur with re peel to salaries and wages or employee 
pensions and benefit , ccount 60 I and 604, respecti ely. 

Account 620, Materials and supplies ex pen e, is e pected to dccrca e to appro imately I 0,400 per 
year from 15,434. The tility will continue to incur e penses associated -. ith the operation, 
maintenance and repair o r di tribution sy tern component and fac ilities such as: -.: ater mains; 
service lines; hydrants; ah es; al e boxes; meters; meter boxes; tools; paint; per onal protecti e 
equipment; and mi c. fittings, bra work , and supplies. 

Account 636, ontractua l ser ices other, will be reduced to approximately I ,800 per year (an 
a erage of 150 per month) from 3,2 16 per year reflecting the ongoing cost of sampling, analyzing 
and reporting the ummertree distribution system's water quality and flow data as mandated by 
FDFP's rul es and regulations. This include daily, monthly, quarterly, annual and triennial 
sampl ing e ents. nee thee isting um mertree Water Use Permit, as issued by outhwest Florida 
Water Management District, is cancelled, a Whole ale Public upply Permit v ill be issued by the 
District, v hi ch will contain pecific monitoring and reporting requirements that will generate 
annual expen e. 

Account 659, Insurance e ·pense, is expected to decrease as a consequence of well abandonment by 
2,296 refl ecting the remo at of the buildings and equipment from the ' ell sites. 

Account 675, Misc. expenses, is e peeled to decrease by appro imately 3,900 per year after the 
v ells are abandoned. llo-. e cr. the Utili ty will continue to incur annual expenses such as: employee 
training and tra el e pen e; uniforms; office uti litie ; office supplie ; alarm systems; meter reading 
expenses; bill ing; postage; shipping; printing supplie ; answering service; license fees; 
communications e pen e; and misc. other expense . 

ln to tal, the tility e peels annual operating e pen e to decrca e by approximately 48,600 after 
the -. e lls arc abandoned. 

6. Please e plain the rca on for the decrea e in the Pasco o unty v ater utility purchased power 
expen e from 20 14 to 20 15. 

Re ponse: 1 he reduction in purcha ed power -. as mai nly due to the loss of our irrigation customers 
at the end of20 14. 
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call. 
hould you or taiT ha\ c any que tion regarding this filing, please do not he itale to gi e me a 

M I·/ 
nclosure 

cc: John lloy (via email) 
Patrick Flynn (via email) 
Danijela Janjic, squire ( ia email) 
l::.rik ayler, E quire ( ia email) 

Very truly yours, 

- ~~:~qM~ 
for the Finn 



tilitics, Inc. of !· lorida 
Docket No. 150269-W 

• Actual Allome) l·ces through March 7, 2016 (lmoiccs & Report ttachcd) . 3.276.00. 
• Actual Costs through March 7, 2016 (InvOices Attached): 758.75 
• riling l·ee: 2,250.00 (not included 111 costs above) 

I 0.0 hrs. 

I· I JMA II· I 0 COMPI 1·'11· R.A II· CA. l· l!IROUGII PA ORDLR 

D~scri uon 

Respond to formal and mlom1al data requests from taff and OPC and I 
any other discovery requests. and miscellaneous correspondence and 
telephone conferences w1th client; 

15 .0 hrs. ----+-A_ttcnd customer meetin s m C\\ Port Richey and Ocala_; 
2.5 hrs . Reviev • • taff recommendation; onference with client and consultants 

regardmg recommendation, Conference w1th tan rcgardmg 
recommendation -------+-- ---- -15.0 hrs. I rnYel to and from Tallahassee; Prepare for and attend Agenda 

1.0 hrs. 
-------+ conference, discuss Agenda v.ith client and taff. __ 

Rcvie\ P A Order; conference with client and consultants regarding 
P A Order 

3.0 hrs. 

[ 46.5 hr~ 
Prepare re\ISed tariiT sheets, obtain Staff appro"\al of tariffs; Draft 
customer notice, obtam talf appro\al; Dran Affidavit of Mmhng; 

I C-oordmate mailmg of eu<:>tomer notices and lm£!ementation of tanffs. 
360!ffil6,7-t0.00 - .• 'T IM ~0 OR E ~ FEE: 

I· stimate of costs to complete. 
$ 860 00 
__ 10.00 

T 
T 
FILl 

70.00 

ttend I wo ' ustomer Meetings, & Agenda onfercnce (travel meal · 'hotel) 
l· sllmated photocop1cr costs 
T T IM TEO A I l BI LLED 'T~' 

I<: D 
ED 

0 



Utilities, Inc. 

Friedman ri dman, P.A. 
766 orth un Drive, utte 4030 

Lake Mat), I lorida 32746 
Phone (407) 830-6331 

F.U.I.: 46~480334 

Ma:y5,2015 

2335 anders Road 
Northbrook, lL 60062 U A 

Invoice No.: 1806 

30057.224 FileNo. : 

t1 ntion : John lover 

PL l ASl Rl I L R I 0 
I VOICI Nl MBl R Will N 

Rl Mill INC, 

RE: UTIUTII: INC. OF FLORIDA 2015 LlMlll:.D PROCEEDING 

04 13 15 M F 

Balance Due o' 

Review, research and respond to correspondence 
from Ms. DiPasquale regardtng legal description 
format 

llour:2 

0.30 

Total Fees 0.30 

108.00 

mount 

108 00 

108.00 

10 .00 



Utilities, Inc. 

Friedman ri dman P. . 
766 orth un Dnve, Ulte 4030 

Lake Mary, Horida 32746 
Phone: (407) 830-6331 

F.E.I.: 46-4480334 

January 5, 2016 

2315 Sanders Road lm oicc No.: 2527 

30057 224 Northbrook, IL 60062 A 

ttcnlion : John tover 

File No. : 

PLEASE REFER TO 
INVOICE NUMBER WI IE·N 

REMITTING 

R t : UTI LITlE INC. OF FLORIDA 2015 LIMITED PROCEEDfNG 

B~ l ~ n c Due ow 2, 9 1.49 

FEE 

I lours Amount 

12.27 15 M f· Rc\ iew Prior P C Orders and letter to Mr. I loy and 0.70 $252.00 
others regarding loss of trrigat10n revenues; Review 

APs in 'arious TartfTs and letter to Mr. Deason and 
others concerning same, 

M (· Review and revise Apphcauon and Jetter to Mr. I loy 0.30 108.00 
and others concerning same; 

12 '29115 M F Rcviev. and comment upon draft MI· Rs; Telephone 0.70 252.00 
Conference with Mr .I loy who telephoned 
concerning same; Finah/.C application and letter to 
Mr. Deason; 

Total Fees 1.70 612.00 

Of B R M T 

mount 



12/16/15 

12/22/15 

Filing Fee 

Fed Ex 

Total Disbursements 

Total Fees & Disbursements 

$2,250.00 

$29.49 

$2,279.49 

$2,891.49 



Utilities, Inc. 

Fried man ri dma n P. 
766 orth un Drive, uitc 4030 

Lake Mary, f-lorida 32746 
Phone: (407) 830-6331 

F.E.I 46-4480334 

February 5, 2016 

2335 anders Road 
orthbrool-., lL 60062 lJ A 

Invoice o.: 2605 

30057.224 I ile No. : 

ttention: John tover 

PL EASE REFI:.R I 0 
INVOICE NUMBER Wlll·N 

REMIITING 

R •: UTILITIE INC. OF FLORIDA 2015 LlMITf:.D PROCf:.EDI G 

Balance Ou c ow I, 96.20 

F 4 

I lours Amount 

01 /23/ 16 M F Research and drafllettcrs to County Administrator of 2. 10 756.00 
Marion. Pasco and eminole Counties; 
Correspondence with Mr. f·lynn ; Research and drafl 
separate Initial Customer Notices; [ etter to Mr. 
Mouring at P ' concemmg same. 

01 26 16 M I· Re ie"' tan's first data request and letter to Mr. llo) 0.20 7200 
and others concerning same, Correspondence \vith 
Mr Mouring at P C tail regarding nottcc; 

01 /27/ 16 M (· Finalize Customer Notices and drafl AOidavits of 0.30 108.00 
Mailing and letter to Mr l lo)' and others concerning 
same; 

01 /28/ 16 M F Research and draflletters to librarians; Letter to Mr. 0.30 $108.00 
Mouring at P C; 

01 /29116 M F Finalize and mail letters to librarians; correspondence 0.30 108.00 
with P C attorney; letter to Mr. Flynn, 



Total Fees 3.20 $1,152.00 

DISBURSEMENTS 
Amount 

01129/16 Legal Advertisment $244.20 

Total Disbursements $244.20 

Total Fees & Disbursements $1,396.20 



- --------------------------------------, 

Utilities, Inc. 

Friedman & Friedman, P.A. 
766 North Sun Drive, Suite 4030 

Lake Mary, Florida 32746 
Phone: ( 407) 830-6331 

F.E.I.: 46-4480334 

March 4, 2016 

2335 Sanders Road 
Northbrook, IL 60062 USA 

Invoice No.: 2705 

30057.224 File No.: 

Attention: John Stover 

PLEASE REFER TO 
INVOICE NUMBER WHEN 

REMITTING. 

RE: UTILITIES INC. OF FLORIDA 2015 LIMITED PROCEEDING 

Balance Due Now $1,745.06 

FEES 
Hours Amount 

02/12/16 MSF Review proposed responses and documents from Mr. 0.60 $216.00 
Flynn and begin draft of response to staffs first data 
request; 

02/14/16 MSF Review and incorporate customer complaints into 0.20 $72.00 
response 

02/15/16 MSF Review documents and responses from Mr. Deason 0.80 $288.00 
and incorporate in first data request responses; 

02/24/16 MSF Begin research and draft of responses to OPC's 0.80 $288.00 
concerns; Research and draft Customer Meeting 
Notices and letter to PSC Staff concerning same; 

02/25/16 MSF Telephone Conference with Mr. Deason who 0.80 $288.00 
telephoned regarding responses to OPC Issues; 
Review Staffs 2nd Data Request and letter to Mr. 
Hoy and other concerning same; Review, revise and 



02/29/16 MSF 

DISBURSEMENTS 

02/05/16 

02/15/16 

02/18/16 

02/23/16 

incorporate Mr. Deason's responses response to OPC 
Issues and Concerns; 

Review comments from PSC Staff on Customer 0.30 
Meeting Notices, and revise Notices accordingly; 
Draft Affidavit of Mailing and letter to Mr. Hoy and · 
others concerning same; 

Total Fees 3.50 

Photocopies 

Legal Notice-Seminole 

Legal Notice-Pasco 

Advertise Legal Notice 

FedEx-Ovemight Delivery 

FedEx-Ovemight Delivery 

Total Disbursements 

Total Fees & Disbursements 

$108.00 

$1,260.00 

Amount 

$59.25 

$49.50 

$49.50 

$244.20 

$45.70 

$36.91 

$485.06 

$1,745.06 



Mar/ B/2016 

Lwyr Lawyer 
Date Matter 
Entry I 

'l'aak 

HSF Hartin S. Friedman 

Client 
Matter Description 
Explanation 

Friedm~n & Friedman, P.A. 
Time Listing 

Mar/ 1/2016 To Mar/ 1/2016 

Mar 2/2016 30057.224 tl'tilitiea, Ina. 
31842 UTILITIES INC, OF FLORIDA 2015 LIMITED PROCEEDING 
No Bold BWM Review, revised and incorporate Mr. Flynn's responses to 

OPC's First Concerns and letter to all concerning same; 

Page: 1 

&our a Rata 'fatal 

util 
0.30 3Ei0.00 108.00 

MSE',_,......,.....Hart:rn-;·sTtrleaman~t-"·""::- ~ -··-,·"':·.::-·--A~-~- ..... - ......,. .. _.r, ___ ,~ • -- - T,.... -- ·-·· .- ~- -.··~..----, ---..........,.~--- ... vY>-.... .,."":"",..'71~~--"-P--=---"'"=~-_, . .,.. __ ~----,...""'i 

~ar ·6/2016 30057.224 i7Ulitiea, Ir;~~.;;: ~.t.fiL0c~·- , . 
32093 UTILITIES INC, OF FLORIDA 2015 LIMITED I'ROCEEDING utii . 
No Bold BWM . Review customer· correspondence filed in docket and staff 
;._ __ : ___ ~·---~~:_,_:,....,,_,~_:....,-=--____:;.__,_,. __ response.s .and lett;er t;o __ Hr_._,Jioy .and others _concerning JJame;_ .· .. 

'l'ask Coda 

BWM - Billable Work Monthly 
Total Billable 

Total: 

Wo.rking Lawyer 

MSF - Martin S. Friedman 
Total; 

REPORT SELECTIONS - Time Listing 
Layout Template 
Advanced Search Filter 
Requested by 
Finished 
Ver 
Date Range 
Matters 
Clients 
Major Clients 
Client Intro Lawyer 
Matter Intro Lawyer 
Responsible Lawyer 
Type of Law 
Select From 
Working Lawyer 
Task 
Summarize by Type of Law 
Sorted by 
Time/Fee 
Include Daily totals 
Include Held Items only 
Matter Security Enabled 
frinted from 

... Summary by Task Code ... 
*** Billable ••• 

••• Summary by Working Lawyer ••• 

Default 
None 
MSF 
Tuesday, March 08, 2016 at 11:46:01 ·AM 
14.1 (14.1.20150324) 
Mar/ 1/201Ei To Mar/ 7/2016 
30051.224 
1'.11 
All 
1'.11 
1'.11 
1'.11 
1'.11 
Active, Inactive, Archived Matters 
1'.11 
All 
No 
Order Entered 
Both 
No 
No 
No 
Register 

0.10 360.00 36.00 

Boura Amount 

0.40 14 4. 00 
0.40 144.00 

0.40 144.00 

Amount 

0.40 144.00 
0.40 144.00 



~Office ... $ 

FedEx Office Is your destination 
for printing and shipping. 

3425 THOMASVILLE RO 
Tallahassee, FL 32309c3493 

Tel: (850) 668-5679 

12/30/2015 2:14:00 PH EST 
Team Hember: Ooshla W. 

SALE 

Bli 1S Copy/Print 959 @ 0.1000 T 
000001 Reg. Price 0.12 

Regular Total 115.08 
Discounts 19.18 

Total 95.90 

Sub-Tot a 1 95.90 
Tax 7.19 
Deposit 0.00 

Total 103.09 

AmEx (S) 103.09 
Account: 7009 
Auth: 526063 (A) 

Total Tender 103.09 
Change Oue 0.00 
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UTILITY NAME: UIJLJTIES INC OF FLORIDA 

SYSTEM NAME/COUNTY: Puco Couary 

ACCT. 
NO. 

,., 
ACCOUNT NAME 

th\ 

TotJI Wutewater Ulility Expenses 

CURRENT 
YEAR 

'•' 

"' 5,951 

185,644 
9,302 
5,S2S 

4,942 
11,799 

0 
640 
(ll) 

1,306 
21 

' 1,020 

1,942 

"' 

'"·'" I. 

.. .2 

COlLEen ON COLLEcnON 
EXPENSES.. EXPE.NSES.. 

OPU:~ONS ·,;;· 

1,888 

" 122 

&- :-1 -"---~= 
117< ""' 

S..I0(1) 
GROUP 

~ ·' 
PUMPING PUMPING 

EXPENSES· EXPENSES-

on~nnoNs MA~~ANCE 

"' •.•. 1 
1,381 

2,832 "' 

Sl 

'*-"~- ! I ~ 
-kill 

8,087 Is 1796 

•• 
TREATMENT 
& DISPOSAL 
EXPENSES­

OPE~~ONS 

, __ 

1,787 
185,644 

9,302 
4,144 

4,942 
4,7l9 

490 

--4 

218.119 

YEAR OF REPORT 
31-Dec-14 

• • 
TREATMENT 
&DISPOSAL 
EXPENSES-

MAIN-r:;.;'ANCE 

715 

g ~:-_,"-'-~.-'_'4 

1.·· .!E33 
1,180 

122 

·--
-J 

3.790 
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__ 73_1_ Conuoctual ServiCes F.namen!!!IJ 
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