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Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, F1. 32399-0850 

7-20-2006 

nc . RE: TG43 1 Palm:Tel Communicatlms, 

To Whom It May Concern 

I sold Palm-Tel Communications as of 1-1 -2005. I no longer operate any payphones, I 
filed the final return in 2004. To the best of my knowledge I do not have any outstanding fees. If 
I am incorrect please contact me. 
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Please confirm that you are requesting cancellation of your pay telephone certificate. In addition, my e-mail from this morning 
explained that if payment of the 2007 and 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fees were not paid, we could not grant the company a 
voluntary cancellation, Therefore, when you reply to this e-mail, please let me know your intentions regarding the past due fee and 
the 2008 fee, A docket will not be established to cancel your certificate until I hear back from you. Thanks for your assistance. 

Paula Mer 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 41 3-6502-Phone 
(850) 41 3-6503-Fax 
Plsler@psc.state.fl.us 

From: Larrypbpr@aol.com [mailto:Larrypbpr@aoI.com] 
Sent: Monday, February 25, 2008 1:23 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: Re: Palm-Tel Communications, Inc. (TG431) 

Palm-Tel is no longer in the phone business and will not be renewing 

Larry Hodges 

II_- 

Delicious ideas to please the pickiest eaters. Watch the video on AOL Living. 

2/25/2008 
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Paula M e r  

From: Paula Mer 

Sent: 

To: 'larrypbpr@aol.com' 

Subject: Palm-Tel Communications, Inc. (TG431) 

Monday, February 25,2008 11 :22 AM 

TO: Larry W. Hodges, President 

Dear Mr. Hodges: 

The Regulatory Assessment Fee is applicable if a cert i f icate is active for  any day during a calendar year whether a 
cert i f icate holder had any revenues or ever started operations. The fee must be postmarked by January 30 th  t o  avoid late 
payment charges. Our records show the  2007 fee, including late payment charges, has not been received. The fee is .0020 
of a cert i f icate holder's intrastate revenues, o r  the minimum $100, whichever is greater. 

If you owe the minimum and if payment is postmarked by February 29, the  amount due is $106 ($100 minimum fee, $5 
penalty, $1 interest). If you owe t h e  minimum and if payment is postmarked between March 1 and March 30, the  amount due 
is $112 ($100 minimum fee, $10 penalty, $2  interest). As information, the  late payment charges continue t o  accrue until t h e  
fee is paid. 

Delinquent notices have now been mailed and if a cert i f icate holder does not comply with t h e  notice within 15 days, 
cert i f icate holders wi l l  automatically be fined $500 for  a f i r s t  offense, $1,000 f o r  a second offense, and $2,000 for  a third 
offense. If Palm-Tel Communications, Inc.  does not comply, it would be fined $1,000 since th is  wi l l  be i t s  second offense of 
the Regulatory Assessment Fee rule violation. 

If you wish t o  cancel your pay telephone certificate, please wri te the  Commission a l e t te r  requesting cancellation. If you 
want a voluntary cancellation, please include payment o f  t h e  2007 and 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fees, including any 
applicable late payment charges. If full payment is not included, the  Commission would st i l l  cancel t h e  certificate, it would 
just be cancelled on the Commission's own motion and any unpaid fees would be turned over t o  collections. 

Please let me know if you have any questions or need a copy of the  2007 (and/or 2008) Regulatory Assessment Fee return 
form(s). Thanks. 

Paula I s le r  
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 
(850) 4 13 -6503 -Fax 
PIsler(3psc.state.f I.us 

212 512008 
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TG43 1 
Palm-Tel Communications, Inc. 
Palm-Tel Communications, Inc. 
5958 
Active 
12/05/1998 
No 
Larry W. Hodges 
President - Treasurer 
1803 South Australian Avenue, Suite A 

West Palm Beach, FL 33409-6454 
1803 South Australian Avenue, Suite A 

West Palm Beach, FL 33409-6454 

Application for certificate to provide pay telephone service by 
Palm-Tel Communications, Inc. 

Compliance investigation of PATS certificate holders for apparent 
first-time violation of Rule 25-4.0161, F.A.C., Regulatory 

Assessment Fees; Telecommunications Companies. 
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