
Jody Lamar Finklea, B.C.S. 
General Counsel and Ch ief Legal Officer 

Board Certified City, County and Local Government Lawyer 

VIA Electronic Filing 

June 21, 2022 

Florida Public Service Commission 
Adam Teitzman, Commission Clerk 
Office of the Commission Clerk 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 

Re: City of Moore Haven, Florida - Revised Tariff Sheets 

Dear Mr. Tei tzman: 

FILED 6/21/2022 
DOCUMENT NO. 04175-2022 
FPSC - COMMISSION CLERK 

This letter is submitted on behalf of the City of Moore Haven, Florida pursuant to Rules 25-9.05 
through 25-9.071 of the Florida Administrative Code. 

Electronically filed are the city's following tariff sheets in legislative and final filing formats: 

a. Fourth Revised Sheet No. 7.0 - Residential Service, and, 
b. Fifth Revised Sheet No. 8.0 - Commercial Services. 

A copy of the city 's Ordinance #350 detailing the changes is also included with this filing. 

Please contact our office if there are any questions. 

Very truly yours, 
/s/ 
Jody Lamar Finklea 
General Counsel and Chief Legal Officer 

Florida Municipal Power Agency 

2061 -2 Delta Way • PO Box 3209 (32315-3209) • Tallahassee, FL 32803 • (850) 297-2011 • www.fmpa.com 



 City of Moore Haven, Florida    ThirdFourth Revised Sheet No. 7.0 
      Cancelling SecondThird Revised Sheet No. 7.0 

 

NAME OF UTILITY:  CITY OF MOORE HAVEN 

RESIDENTIAL SERVICE 

AVAILABILITY: 

 Throughout the City’s service area from distribution lines in accordance with City 
 ordinances relating to electric service. 

APPLICABILITY: 

 For all domestic uses, the residential consumer is a separately metered, single family 
 dwelling unit and for Churches whose premises are used exclusively for such purposes. 

CHARACTER OF SERVICE 

 Single phase, sixty (60) hertz, at available standard voltage. 

MONTHLY RATE 

 Residential 

 _________ 

 Monthly customer charge     $8.509.14 
 Charge per each KkWh     $0.0730.080410 
 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: 
 
 Bills rendered under residential rates are due and payable upon receipt in accordance with 
 the City’s ordinance relating to electric service. 
 
FUEL ADJUSTMENT: 
 
 See Sheet No. 10.0 
 
UTILITY TAX: 
 
 See Sheet No. 11.0 
 
 
 
Issued by: Frank E. BirdwellLarry Tibbs  Effective: MarchJuly 1, 19962022 
  MayorCity Manager  



City of Moore Haven, Florida      Fourth Revised Sheet No. 7.0 
               Cancelling Third Revised Sheet No. 7.0 

 

RESIDENTIAL SERVICE 

 

AVAILABILITY: 

 Throughout the City’s service area from distribution lines in accordance with City 
 ordinances relating to electric service. 

APPLICABILITY: 

 For all domestic uses, the residential consumer is a separately metered, single family 
 dwelling unit and for churches whose premises are used exclusively for such purposes. 

CHARACTER OF SERVICE: 

 Single-phase, sixty (60) hertz, at available standard voltage. 

MONTHLY RATE: 

 Residential 

 _________ 

 Monthly customer charge     $9.14 
 Charge per each kWh      $0.080410 
 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: 
 
 Bills rendered under residential rates are due and payable upon receipt in accordance with 
 the City’s ordinance relating to electric service. 
 
FUEL ADJUSTMENT: 
 
 See Sheet No. 10.0. 
 
UTILITY TAX: 
 
 See Sheet No. 11.0. 
 
 
 
Issued by: Larry Tibbs     Effective: July 1, 2022 
  City Manager  



City of Moore Haven, Florida     FourthFifth Revised Sheet No. 8.0 
      Cancelling ThirdFourth Revised Sheet No. 8 

NAME OF UTILITY:  CITY OF MOORE HAVEN 

COMMERCIAL SERVICES 

AVAILABILITY: 

Throughout the City’s service area from distribution lines in accordance with City ordinances relating to 
electric service. 

APPLICABILITY: 

“Commercial unit: is defined as being a business activity for which an occupational license is now or 
hereafter required by the City and / or Glades County.  General Service Demand rates shall apply if the 
measured monthly demand is 20 kW or more for three or more months out of the past twelve months.  
Also available to customers with a lower demand requirement who agree to remain on demand rates for at 
least one year. 

Single and three phase at available secondary voltage. 

MONTHLY RATES: 

General Service Non-Demand 

Monthly customer charge      $  8.509.47 
Charge per each KkWh           0.0880.094493 
 
General Service Demand 
 
Monthly customer charge      $ 30.0036.01 
Charge per each KkWh       $   0.0510.051923 
Charge per each KkW, 20 KkW minimum    $   8.059.728750 
 
TERMS OF PAYMENT 
 
Bills rendered under commercial rates are due and payable upon receipt in accordance with the City’s 
ordinance relating to electric service. 
 
POWER COST ADJUSTMENT: 
 
See Sheet No. 10.0 
 
UTILITY TAX 
 
See Sheet No. 11.0 
 
SALES TAX 
 
See sheet No. 11.0 
 
Issued by: Harry H. OgletreeLarry Tibbs  Effective : JanuaryJuly 1, 19992022 
  MayorCity Manager 



City of Moore Haven, Florida      Fifth Revised Sheet No. 8.0 
              Cancelling Fourth Revised Sheet No.8 

 

COMMERCIAL SERVICES 

 

AVAILABILITY: 

Throughout the City’s service area from distribution lines in accordance with City ordinances 
relating to electric service. 

APPLICABILITY: 

“Commercial unit” is defined as being a business activity for which an occupational license is now 
or hereafter required by the city and / or Glades County.  General Service Demand rates shall apply 
if the measured monthly demand is 20-kW or more for three or more months out of the past twelve 
months.  Also available to customers with a lower demand requirement who agree to remain on 
demand rates for at least one year. 

Single and three-phase at available secondary voltage. 

MONTHLY RATES: 

General Service Non-Demand 

Monthly customer charge      $ 9.47 
Charge per each kWh       $ 0.094493 
 
General Service Demand 
 
Monthly customer charge      $36.01 
Charge per each kWh       $  0.051923 
Charge per each kW, 20-kW minimum    $  9.728750 
 
TERMS OF PAYMENT: 
 
Bills rendered under commercial rates are due and payable upon receipt in accordance with the 
City’s ordinance relating to electric service. 
 
POWER COST ADJUSTMENT:  See Sheet No. 10.0. 
 
UTILITY TAX:  See Sheet No. 11.0. 
 
SALES TAX:  See sheet No. 11.0. 
 
 
Issued by: Larry Tibbs     Effective: July 1, 2022 
  City Manager 



ORDINANCE # 350 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
MOORE HA VEN, FLORIDA, AMENDING ORDINANCE 283, 
CHAPTER 115, ARTICLE II, SECTIONS 115-8 AND 115-9 OF 
THE MOORE HAVEN CITY CODE BY UPDATING CERTAIN 
RATES OF THE CITY'S ELECTRIC UTILITY RELATED TO 
RESIDENT SERVICE AND COMMERCIAL SERVICES; 
PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; REPEALING ALL 
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; PROVIDING FOR 
AUTHORITY TO CODIFY; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE 
DATE. 

WHEREAS, the City of Moore Haven, Florida (the City) has not changed its 
residential service and commercial services electric rates since the enactment of 
Ordinance 283 in October 2005; 

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to provide for the necessary costs of the 
City's electric utility to provide safe, reliable, and responsible electric service and to 
provide the customers of the City's electric utility with the lowest possible costs for 
that electric service; 

WHEREAS, the State of Florida and the United States of America are 
currently experiencing a tremendous increase in prices of many items needed by 
everyone in the City for daily life, including energy costs; 

WHEREAS, the City's adoption of this ordinance is required to comply with, 
and is expressly authorized by Florida law, including, but not limited to, part I of 
chapter 166, Florida Statutes; 

WHEREAS, this ordinance relates both to the budget of the City and a revenue 
source necessary to fund the budget, as the City's electric utility operations are 
contemplated in the City's budget to provide a key source of revenue for the City; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council hereby finds and determines that the adoption of 
this ordinance is necessary and appropriate to provide for the City's electric utility 
operations, and for ensuring the continued low cost of those electric utility operations, 
which are vital to promoting, enabling, and facilitating the City's provision of 
economic competitiveness for its residents, businesses, and visitors. 

- 1 -



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY 
OF MOORE HAVEN, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 1. INCORPORATION OF RECITALS. The above recitals 
are true and accurate and are hereby incorporated herein and made a material part of 
this ordinance. 

SECTION 2. AMENDMENT TO SECTION 115-8. Chapter 115, 
Article II, Section 115-8 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Moore Haven, 
Florida, entitled "Residential service," is hereby amended as follows: 

(i) The monthly customer charge, set forth in section 115-8(D.)(1), is hereby 
amended by deleting "$8.50" and replacing it with "$9.14." 

(ii) The charge per each kWh, set forth in section 115-8(D.)(2), is hereby amended 
by deleting "$0.0748" and replacing it with "$0.080410." 

SECTION 3. AMENDMENT TO SECTION 115-9. Chapter 115, 
Article II, Section 115-9 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Moore Haven, 
Florida, entitled "Commercial services," is hereby amended as follows: 

(i) The monthly customer charge for general service non-demand, set forth in 
section 115-9(C.)(l)(a), is hereby amended by deleting "$8.50" and replacing it 
with "$9.14." 

(ii) The charge per each kWh for general service non-demand, set forth in section 
l 15-9(C.)(l)(b), is hereby amended by deleting "$0.0879" and replacing it with 
"$0. 094493." 

(iii) The monthly customer charge for general service demand, set forth in section 
l 15-9(C.)(2)(a), is hereby amended by deleting "$33.50" and replacing it with 
"$36.01." 

(iv) The charge per each kWh for general service demand, set forth in section l 15-
9(C.)(2)(b), is hereby amended by deleting "$0.0483" and replacing it with 
"$0.051923." 

(v) The charge per each kw, 20 kw minimum, for general service demand, set forth 
in section 115-9(C.)(2)(c), is hereby amended by deleting "$9.05" and replacing 
it with "$9.728750." 

SECTION 4. SA VIN GS CLAUSE. If any section, paragraph, 
sentence, clause, phrase, or work of this Ordinance shall be held unconstitutional, 

- 2 -



invalid, or unenforceable, such holding shall not affect any of the remaining portions 
hereof. 

SECTION 5. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES. All 
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 6. AUTHORITY TO CODIFY. Specific authority is hereby 
granted to codify this Ordinance. 

SECTION 7. EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ord\nance shall become 
effective as of the City's electric utility billing cycle beginning v U hf I , 2022. 

PASSED this 17th day of May, 2022, on the first reading by a vote of 5-0 

PASSED AND ADOPTED this 7th day of June, 2022, on second reading by a vote of 
5-0. 

Attest: 

~ ( j) ii.ff/) Ash1eyWilli v 

City Clerk 

CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF MOORE HAVEN, FLORIDA 

Bret Whidden 
Mayor 

- 3 -


	PSC - eFiling Cover Letter - 20220524
	4th Rev. Sh. No. 7.0 - RES. - LEGIS 2022
	4th Rev. Sh. No. 7.0 - RES. - FILING 2022
	5th Rev. Sh. No. 8.0 - GSD - LEGIS 2022
	5th Rev. Sh. No. 8.0 - GSD - FILING 2022
	#350 {Amending Electric Utility Rates} 6 10 2021



