
Antonia Hover 

CORRESPONDENCE 
8/13/2025 
DOCUMENT NO. 07886-2025 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

Ellen Plendl 
Wednesday, August 13, 2025 4:01 PM 
Consumer Correspondence 
Docket Nos. 20240026 & 20240172 
FW: Teco, tampa electric company in tampa 

See attached customer correspondence for Docket Nos. 20240026 & 20240172. 
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Antonia Hover 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

Governor's Office of Citizen Services < EOGCitizenServices@eog.myflorida.com> 
Wednesday, August 13, 2025 3:36 PM 
Ellen Plendl 
FW: Teco, tampa electric company in tampa 
2025081 3_133941.jpg 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside your organization. Exercise caution when opening attachments 
or clicking links, especially from unknown senders. 

Please find attached email received by the Governor's Office of Citizen Services. This email is forwarded to your office 
for review and any response or action appropriate. 

Thank you. 

Sincerely, 

Martha Lynn 
Office of Citizen Services 
Executive Office of the Governor 

From: Jane's hughes <noreply@flgov.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2025 1:42 PM 
To: GovernorRon.DeSantis@eog.myflorida.com 
Subject: Teco, tampa electric company in tampa 

Submitted 
Wed, 08/13/2025 - 13:41 

Sender Information 
Jane's hughes 
pabooken@gmail.com 
8169610749 

Subject 
Teco, tampa electric company in tampa 

Message 
Teco has doubled our bills. They are charging us extra for the storms they had last year. Instead of te h having 
to pay fir what the need the suck it from their customers. We need your help to make te h accountable to pay fir 
their own issues. Light bill normally 300 abd something now it's doubled it 6m$ 607. 

IP Address 
172.69.132.137 

User Agent 
Mozilla/5.0 (Linux; Android 10; K) AppleWebKit/537.36 (KHTML, like Gecko) Chrome/1 39.0.0.0 Mobile 
Safari/537.36 

1 



Please note that under Florida law correspondence sent to the Governor's Office, which is not confidential or 
exempt pursuant to chapter 119 of the Florida Statutes, is a public record made available upon request. 
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date rm y be assessed a late payment charge and an additional deposit. 

Oy August 29, 2025 _ . $603.10 

| 2024 | 2025 


